

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 - 2 Bituminous Mix Materials

ITEMS	Ace-Saginaw Pav.	Cadillac Asphalt	Ajax Materials	
	Kari Wilcox	Deven Rau	Brian Borich	
	810-238-1738	248-620-7952	248-244-3355	
PLANT MIX 13A	Per Ton	Per Ton		
PICKED UP	\$76.00	NO BID	\$75.00	
FOB LAPEER	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
FOB NB	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
FOB IC	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
UPM				
PICKED UP	NO BID	\$120.00	\$125.00	
FOB LAPEER	NO BID	\$145.00	\$140.00	
FOB NB	NO BID	\$150.00	\$140.00	
FOB IC	NO BID	\$145.00	\$140.00	
QPR 2000				
PICKED UP	\$135.00	NO BID	NO BID	
FOB LAPEER	\$127.00	NO BID	NO BID	
FOB NB	\$126.00	NO BID	NO BID	
FOB IC	\$129.00	NO BID	NO BID	
*Alternate				
PICKED UP	No Bid	No Bid	\$115.00	
FOB LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	\$135.00	
FOB NB	No Bid	No Bid	\$135.00	
FOB IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	\$135.00	