

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2025 - 2 Bituminous Mix Materials

ITEMS	Ace-Saginaw Paving	Pavt Maintenance System	Lakeland Asphalt	Ajax Materials
	Nathan Gotts	Julie Dockham	Richard VanDerhoff	Brian Borich
	989-755-8147	810-724-4767	269-964-1720	248-244-6326

PLANT MIX 13A	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton
PICKED UP	\$ 79.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 89.25
FOB LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB NB	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB IC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

UPM				
PICKED UP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 135.00
FOB LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 140.25
FOB NB	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 140.75
FOB IC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 140.25

QPR 2000				
PICKED UP	\$ 130.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB LAPEER	\$ 132.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB NB	\$ 132.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB IC	\$ 133.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

<i>*Alternate</i>	<i>CM-150, CM-200, CM-300</i>		<i>BMP Cold Patch</i>	
PICKED UP	No Bid	\$ 120.00	\$ 115.00	No Bid
FOB LAPEER	No Bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 127.00	No Bid
FOB NB	No Bid	\$ 127.00	\$ 127.00	No Bid
FOB IMLAY	No Bid	\$ 123.00	\$ 127.00	No Bid

Bituminous Mixture 3EML (Tier 1) PG 64-28

PICKED UP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 94.25
FOB LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB NB	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bituminous Mixture 4EML (Tier 1) PG 64-28

PICKED UP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 95.25
FOB LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB NB	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bituminous Mixture 5EML (Tier 1) PG 64-28

PICKED UP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 99.75
FOB LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB NB	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bituminous Mixture 3EML (Tier 2) PG 64-28

PICKED UP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 89.50
FOB LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB NB	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOB IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid