

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2025-3 Aggregates

ITEMS	Detroit Bulk Storage, Inc.	Weber	Burroughs North	Latigo Transport	Stoneco of Michigan	JT Express
Telephone	313-841-7470	810-793-7067	989-737-4671	810-724-0006	734-770-5733	810-724-6471
SAND 2NS						
N. BRANCH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.42	No Bid	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.15	No Bid	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.25	No Bid	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.00	No Bid	\$ 9.50
BANK RUN SAND						
N. BRANCH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	\$ 3.00	No Bid	\$ 4.50	No Bid	No Bid
21AA CRUSHED AGG.						
N. BRANCH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27.15	No Bid	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28.05	No Bid	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27.68	No Bid	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.50	No Bid	\$ 19.00
22A NATURAL AGG.						
N. BRANCH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	\$ 9.50	No Bid	\$ 10.50	No Bid	No Bid
23A NATURAL AGG.						
N. BRANCH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	\$ 9.50	No Bid	\$ 10.50	No Bid	No Bid
23A LIMESTONE						
N. BRANCH	\$ 26.49	No Bid	\$ 29.70	\$ 26.40	\$ 29.58	No Bid
IMLAY	\$ 26.09	No Bid	\$ 30.50	\$ 25.30	\$ 29.88	No Bid
LAPEER	\$ 26.89	No Bid	\$ 29.70	\$ 26.00	\$ 29.28	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.00	No Bid
22A LIMESTONE						
N. BRANCH	\$ 26.44	No Bid	\$ 29.70	\$ 26.40	No Bid	No Bid
IMLAY	\$ 27.39	No Bid	\$ 30.50	\$ 25.30	No Bid	No Bid
LAPEER	\$ 26.89	No Bid	\$ 29.70	\$ 26.10	No Bid	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.00	\$ 25.50	No Bid	No Bid

ITEMS	Detroit Bulk Storage, Inc.	Weber	Burroughs North	Latigo Transport	Stoneco of Michigan	JT Express
Telephone	313-841-7470	810-793-7067	989-737-4671	810-724-0006	734-770-5733	810-724-6471
21AA LIMESTONE						
N. BRANCH	\$ 26.44	No Bid	\$ 29.70	\$ 26.40	\$ 30.08	No Bid
IMLAY	\$ 27.39	No Bid	\$ 30.50	\$ 25.30	\$ 30.38	No Bid
LAPEER	\$ 26.89	No Bid	\$ 29.70	\$ 26.10	\$ 29.78	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.00	No Bid
7A LIMESTONE (1 1/2" - 2")						
N. BRANCH	\$ 33.75	No Bid	\$ 34.30	\$ 35.50	No Bid	No Bid
IMLAY	\$ 34.49	No Bid	\$ 36.55	\$ 34.50	No Bid	No Bid
LAPEER	\$ 32.74	No Bid	\$ 35.05	\$ 34.50	No Bid	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.99	\$ 36.50	No Bid	No Bid
6A LIMESTONE						
N. BRANCH	\$ 31.64	No Bid	\$ 34.70	\$ 31.30	\$ 35.58	No Bid
IMLAY	\$ 32.24	No Bid	\$ 35.50	\$ 30.30	\$ 35.88	No Bid
LAPEER	\$ 32.39	No Bid	\$ 34.70	\$ 30.30	\$ 35.28	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.00	\$ 35.35	\$ 31.00	No Bid
5A LIMESTONE (3" - 5")						
N. BRANCH	\$ 39.74	No Bid	\$ 46.50	\$ 39.75	No Bid	No Bid
IMLAY	\$ 39.74	No Bid	\$ 47.90	\$ 39.75	No Bid	No Bid
LAPEER	\$ 40.74	No Bid	\$ 46.50	\$ 40.75	No Bid	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 35.00	\$ 41.75	No Bid	No Bid
Rip Rap (4"x12")						
N. BRANCH	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 48.50	\$ 42.00	\$ 41.00	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.90	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.50	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 48.70	\$ 40.00	\$ 39.50	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 38.75	\$ 42.00	\$ 25.50	No Bid
Rip Rap (8"x16")						
N. BRANCH	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 77.25	\$ 68.00	\$ 72.30	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 79.65	\$ 67.00	\$ 72.00	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 77.45	\$ 67.00	\$ 70.00	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 69.00	\$ 51.00	No Bid
Rip Rap (24"x36")						
N. BRANCH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 73.00	\$ 77.30	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 72.00	\$ 77.00	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 72.00	\$ 75.00	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 74.00	\$ 56.00	No Bid
Cl II Sand						
N. BRANCH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid
AT PIT	No Bid	\$ 4.25	No Bid	\$ 4.50	No Bid	\$ 4.50