

Lapeer County Road Commission
2025 - 5 Dust Control

NATURAL BRINE
DELIVERED & SPREAD

CALCIUM CHLORIDE 38%
DELIVERED & SPREAD

<i>Company</i>	Wilkinson	Corrigan Oil Company	Chloride Solutions	Big Barney's
<i>TELEPHONE NUMBER</i>	989-843-6163	734-237-5950	517-803-4726	517-546-8755

<i>Company</i>	Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales
<i>TELEPHONE NUMBER</i>	989-684-5860

Township				
ALMONT	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
ARCADIA	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
ATTICA	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
BURLINGTON	\$ 0.220	No Bid	\$ 0.260	No Bid
BURNSIDE	\$ 0.220	No Bid	\$ 0.260	No Bid
DEERFIELD	\$ 0.220	No Bid	\$ 0.260	No Bid
DRYDEN	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
ELBA	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
GOODLAND	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
HADLEY	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
IMLAY	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
LAPEER	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
MARATHON	\$ 0.220	No Bid	\$ 0.260	No Bid
MAYFIELD	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
METAMORA	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
NORTH BRANCH	\$ 0.220	No Bid	\$ 0.260	No Bid
OREGON	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.184	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
RICH	\$ 0.220	No Bid	\$ 0.260	\$ 0.230
Pick up at Plant	\$ 0.090	\$ 0.100	\$ 0.260	No Bid

Township	
ALMONT	\$ 0.783
ARCADIA	\$ 0.783
ATTICA	\$ 0.783
BURLINGTON	\$ 0.783
BURNSIDE	\$ 0.783
DEERFIELD	\$ 0.783
DRYDEN	\$ 0.783
ELBA	\$ 0.783
GOODLAND	\$ 0.783
HADLEY	\$ 0.783
IMLAY	\$ 0.783
LAPEER	\$ 0.783
MARATHON	\$ 0.783
MAYFIELD	\$ 0.783
METAMORA	\$ 0.783
NORTH BRANCH	\$ 0.783
OREGON	\$ 0.783
RICH	\$ 0.783
Pick up at Plant	\$ 0.783