

**Lapeer County Road Commission**  
2025 - 6 Culverts

*Company*  
*Telephone*

**Jensen Bridge & Supply**  
**810-648-3000**

<b>CORRUGATED METAL PIPE</b>		<b>CMP</b>		<b>Polymer Coated</b>	
<b>Circular</b>					
<b>SIZE</b>	<b>DIAMETER (Inches)</b>	<b>GAUGE</b>	<b>Cost per Lin Ft</b>	<b>Cost per Lin Ft</b>	
2 2/3 X 1/2	12	16	\$ 7.80	\$ 11.14	
	15	16	\$ 9.77	\$ 13.78	
	18	16	\$ 10.80	\$ 16.49	
	21	16	\$ 13.97	\$ 19.09	
	24	16	\$ 15.37	\$ 21.79	
	30	14	\$ 24.68	\$ 33.30	
	36	14	\$ 29.25	\$ 40.18	
	42	14	\$ 34.50	\$ 48.05	
	48	12	\$ 54.87	No Bid	
	48	14	No Bid	\$ 56.03	
3 x 1	54	12	\$ 68.54	No Bid	
	54	14	No Bid	\$ 73.91	
	60	12	\$ 75.29	No Bid	
	60	14	No Bid	\$ 80.55	
	66	12	\$ 88.38	No Bid	
	66	14	No Bid	\$ 94.65	

<b>CORRUGATED METAL PIPE</b>		<b>CMP</b>		<b>Polymer Coated</b>	
<b>ARCHES</b>					
<b>SIZE</b>	<b>DIAMETER (Inches)</b>	<b>GAUGE</b>	<b>Cost per Lin Ft</b>	<b>Cost per Lin Ft</b>	
2 2/3 X 1/3	17X13	16	\$ 10.26	\$ 14.47	
	21X15	16	\$ 11.34	\$ 17.31	
	24X18	16	\$ 14.67	\$ 20.04	
	28X20	16	\$ 16.14	\$ 22.88	
	35X24	14	\$ 25.91	\$ 34.97	
	42X29	14	\$ 30.71	\$ 42.19	
	49X33	14	\$ 36.23	\$ 50.45	
3 X 1	48" 53 x 41	12	\$ 57.61	No Bid	
	48" 53 x 41	14	No Bid	\$ 58.83	
	54" 60 x 46	12	\$ 71.97	\$ 93.80	
	60" 66 x 51	12	\$ 79.05	\$ 103.24	
	66" 73 x 55	12	\$ 92.80	\$ 119.43	
	72" 81 x 59	12	\$ 101.07	\$ 128.87	

**PLASTIC CULVERT**

<b>DIAMETER (Inches)</b>	<b>Cost per Lin Ft</b>
4"	No Bid
6"	No Bid
12"	No Bid
15"	No Bid
18"	No Bid
24"	No Bid