

**Lapeer County Road Commission**  
2025 - 7 Traffic Control Signs and Related Material

MDOT Code / Description	Background Color	Size (w x h)	Grade	Unit	Dornbos Sign & Safety 517-543-4000	Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC 740-998-5363	Michigan State Industries 517-249-0873
<b>Part 1A - High Intensity Prismatic (ASTM Type IV) on 0.08" Flat Aluminum (Type III)</b>							
OM2-2V - Vertical Object Marker	Yellow	6" x 12"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 4.14	\$ 3.00	\$ 2.43
R8-3 - No Parking Symbol (2-color)	White	12" x 12"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 7.30	\$ 6.15	\$ 4.85
R1-3P - All Way (Plaque)	Red	18" x 6"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 5.46	\$ 4.50	\$ 3.64
OM4-3 - Type 4 Object Marker (End of Roadway)	Red	18" x 18"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 11.87	\$ 13.43	\$ 10.91
W4-4p - Cross Traffic Does Not Stop	Yellow	24" x 12"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 10.55	\$ 11.94	\$ 9.70
R5-2 - No Trucks Symbol (2 color)	White	24" x 24"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 21.11	\$ 24.20	\$ 19.40
R4-1 - Do Not Pass	White	24" x 30"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 26.38	\$ 29.85	\$ 24.25
R4-2 - Pass with Care	White	24" x 30"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 26.38	\$ 29.85	\$ 24.25
R1-1 - Stop Sign	Red	30" x 30"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 31.48	\$ 36.95	\$ 30.31
R1-1 - Stop Sign	Red	36" x 36"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 44.49	\$ 53.73	\$ 43.65
W4-4p - Cross Traffic Does Not Stop	Yellow	36" x 18"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 23.75	\$ 26.87	\$ 21.83
W3-5 - Reduced Speed Limit Ahead (Blank Speed)	Yellow	36" x 36"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 52.91	\$ 57.48	\$ 43.65
W3-1 - Stop Ahead Sign (3 color)	Yellow	36" x 36"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 52.91	\$ 57.48	\$ 44.65
W10-1 - Advance Railroad Grade Crossing (Circle)	Yellow	36" x 36"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 47.49	\$ 53.73	\$ 43.65
S1-1 - Advance School Warning (Pentagon)	Fluorescent	36" x 36"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 47.49	\$ 64.98	\$ 43.65
W14-3 - No Passing Zone	Yellow	48" x 36"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 35.47	\$ 36.20	\$ 58.20

**Part 1B - Signs 0.08" Flatt Aluminum - No Sheeting**

Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	9" x 24"	Blank	Each	\$ 6.55	\$ 5.33	\$ 4.76
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	9" x 30"	Blank	Each	\$ 8.20	\$ 6.66	\$ 5.94
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	9" x 36"	Blank	Each	\$ 9.82	\$ 7.99	\$ 7.13
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	12" x 12"	Blank	Each	\$ 4.36	\$ 3.55	\$ 3.17
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	12" x 36"	Blank	Each	\$ 11.19	\$ 10.65	\$ 9.51
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	18" x 18"	Blank	Each	\$ 8.39	\$ 7.99	\$ 7.13
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	18" x 24"	Blank	Each	\$ 11.19	\$ 10.65	\$ 9.51
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	24" x 24"	Blank	Each	\$ 14.92	\$ 14.20	\$ 12.68
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	24" x 30"	Blank	Each	\$ 18.65	\$ 17.75	\$ 15.85
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	30" x 30"	Blank	Each	\$ 23.31	\$ 22.19	\$ 19.81
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	36" x 36"	Blank	Each	\$ 33.57	\$ 31.95	\$ 28.53
Blank Aluminum Sign - No Sheeting	Aluminum	48" x 24"	Blank	Each	\$ 29.84	\$ 28.40	\$ 25.36

**Part 1C - High Intensity Prismatic (ASTM Type IV) - Sign Faces**

R1-1 - Stop Sign - Face Only	Red	30" x 30"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 9.67	\$ 13.19	\$ 9.31
R1-1 - Stop Sign - Face Only	Red	36" x 36"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 13.93	\$ 18.99	\$ 13.41
R4-1 - Do Not Pass - Face Only	White	24" x 30"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 8.74	\$ 10.55	\$ 7.45
R4-2 - Pass with Care - Face Only	White	24" x 30"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 8.74	\$ 10.55	\$ 7.45
W3-1 - Stop Ahead (3 color) - Face Only	Yellow	36" x 36"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 19.34	\$ 22.74	\$ 11.31
W3-3 - Signal Ahead (3 color) - Face Only	Yellow	36" x 36"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 19.34	\$ 22.20	\$ 11.31
W1-6 - Directional Arrow - Face Only	Yellow	48" x 24"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 12.38	\$ 16.88	\$ 11.92
W1-7 - Bi-Directional Arrow - Face Only	Yellow	48" x 24"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 12.38	\$ 16.88	\$ 11.92

MDOT Code / Description	Background Color	Size	Grade	Unit	Dornbos Sign & Safety 517-543-4000	Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC 740-998-5363	Michigan State Industries 517-249-0873
-------------------------	------------------	------	-------	------	---------------------------------------	--	---

**Part 2 - Posts**

U-Channel Post, Galvanized 3 lb / ft		12 ft	3 lb	Each	\$ 40.80	\$ 60.96	No Bid
U-Channel Post, Galvanized 3 lb / ft		13 ft	3 lb	Each	\$ 44.20	\$ 66.04	No Bid
U-Channel Post, Galvanized 3 lb / ft		14 ft	3 lb	Each	\$ 47.60	\$ 71.12	No Bid
U-Channel Post, Galvanized 3 lb / ft		16 ft	3 lb	Each	\$ 54.40	\$ 81.28	No Bid
U-Channel Post, Galvanized 1.12 lb / ft		7 ft	1.12 lb	Each	\$ 9.95	\$ 11.90	No Bid
Galvanized Square Tubing w/ Holes		1-1/4" x 30"	Unistrut	Each	\$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	No Bid
Wood Post, 4" x 6"		16 ft		Each	\$ 201.76	\$ 0.00	No Bid
Wood Post, 4" x 6"		18 ft		Each	\$ 222.76	\$ 0.00	No Bid
Wood Post, 6" x 8"		16 ft		Each	\$ 357.72	\$ 0.00	No Bid
Wood Post, 6" x 8"		18 ft		Each	\$ 403.08	\$ 0.00	No Bid
Steel Sleeves for Wood Posts for 4" x 6"		3 ft		Each	\$ 206.96	\$ 0.00	No Bid
Steel Sleeves for Wood Posts for 6" x 8"		4.5 ft		Each	\$ 255.54	\$ 0.00	No Bid
Flex Delineator Post w/ 3" x 6" Yellow Hi-Int Decal	Yellow	6-ft	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 23.87	\$ 23.65	No Bid
Flex Delineator Post w/ 3" x 6" Green Hi-Int Decal	Green	6-ft	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 23.87	\$ 23.65	No Bid

**Part 3 - Special Items**

Vertical Retroreflective Strip for Sign Support	Red	3" x 48"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 6.81	\$ 6.50	\$ 4.85
Vertical Retroreflective Strip for Sign Support	Yellow	3" x 48"	HI Prismatic	Each	\$ 6.81	\$ 6.50	\$ 4.85
3M 3930 High Intensity Prismatic Type IV Sheeting	White	36" x 50 yd	HI Prismatic	Roll	\$ 581.50	\$ 607.50	\$ 445.50
3M 3931 High Intensity Prismatic Type IV Sheeting	Yellow	36" x 50 yd	HI Prismatic	Roll	\$ 581.50	\$ 607.50	\$ 445.50
3M 4090 Diamond Grade Reflective Sheeting	White	36" x 50 yd	Diamond	Roll	\$ 1,099.00	\$ 1,246.50	\$ 1,296.00
3M 4081 Diamond Grade Reflective Sheeting	Fluorescent Yellow	36" x 50 yd	Diamond	Roll	\$ 1,099.00	\$ 1,246.50	\$ 1,296.00
3M 4083 Diamond Grade Reflective Sheeting	Fluorescent Yellow-Green	36" x 50 yd	Diamond	Roll	\$ 1,099.00	\$ 1,246.50	\$ 1,296.00
Type II Barricades	Orange / White			Each	\$ 93.74	\$ 66.40	No Bid
Type III Barricades - Double Sided (Closure Sheeting Layout)	Orange / White			Each	\$ 416.98	\$ 288.00	No Bid
Plastic Drums	Orange / White			Each	\$ 82.18	\$ 69.50	No Bid