

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2025-10 GRAVEL HAUL / Alternate 1

Contractor Supply Material/Furnishing, Delivering and Spreading

<i>Company</i>	Detroit Bulk			<i>Company</i>	Detroit Bulk			<i>Company</i>	Detroit Bulk		
	Stoneco of MI <i>Telephone</i>	Latigo	Storage		Stoneco of MI <i>Telephone</i>	Latigo	Storage		Stoneco of MI <i>Telephone</i>	Latigo	Storage
	734-770-5733	810-724-0006	313-841-7470	734-770-5733	810-724-0006	313-841-7470	734-770-5733	810-724-0006	313-841-7470		
TOWNSHIP	22A Natural Per Ton	22A Natural Per Ton	22A Natural Per Ton	23A Natural Per Ton	23A Natural Per Ton	23A Natural Per Ton	21 AA Natural Per Ton	21 AA Natural Per Ton	21 AA Natural Per Ton		
ALMONT	No Bid	\$ 16.45	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.45	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
ARCADIA	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
ATTICA	No Bid	\$ 16.45	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.45	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
BURLINGTON	No Bid	\$ 17.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
BURNSIDE	No Bid	\$ 16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
DEERFIELD	No Bid	\$ 16.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
DRYDEN	No Bid	\$ 16.55	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.55	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
ELBA	No Bid	\$ 18.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
GOODLAND	No Bid	\$ 15.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
HADLEY	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
IMLAY	No Bid	\$ 16.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
LAPEER	No Bid	\$ 16.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
MARATHON	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
MAYFIELD	No Bid	\$ 16.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
METAMORA	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
NORTH BRANCH	No Bid	\$ 17.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
OREGON	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		
RICH	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid		

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2025-10 GRAVEL HAUL / Alternate 1

Contractor Supply Material/Furnishing, Delivering and Spreading

TOWNSHIP	Stoneco of MI	Latigo	Detroit Bulk	Stoneco of MI	Latigo	Detroit Bulk	Stoneco of MI	Latigo	Detroit Bulk
	734-770-5733	810-724-0006	Storage 313-841-7470	734-770-5733	810-724-0006	Storage 313-841-7470	734-770-5733	810-724-0006	Storage 313-841-7470
	22A	22A	22A	23A	23A	23A	21 AA	21 AA	21 AA
Limestone Per Ton	Limestone Per Ton	Limestone Per Ton	Limestone Per Ton	Limestone Per Ton	Limestone Per Ton	Limestone Per Ton	Limestone Per Ton	Limestone Per Ton	Limestone Per Ton
ALMONT	No Bid	\$ 25.90	No Bid	\$ 30.78	\$ 24.90	\$ 25.64	\$ 31.28	\$ 25.90	\$ 25.64
ARCADIA	No Bid	\$ 28.05	No Bid	\$ 30.72	\$ 27.05	\$ 28.69	\$ 31.22	\$ 28.05	\$ 28.69
ATTICA	No Bid	\$ 26.75	No Bid	\$ 30.78	\$ 25.75	\$ 27.39	\$ 31.28	\$ 26.75	\$ 27.39
BURLINGTON	No Bid	\$ 29.30	No Bid	\$ 32.28	\$ 28.30	\$ 29.75	\$ 32.78	\$ 29.30	No Bid
BURNSIDE	No Bid	\$ 29.95	No Bid	\$ 32.28	\$ 28.95	\$ 30.25	\$ 32.78	\$ 29.95	No Bid
DEERFIELD	No Bid	\$ 29.30	No Bid	\$ 28.98	\$ 28.30	\$ 30.25	\$ 29.48	\$ 29.30	No Bid
DRYDEN	No Bid	\$ 26.45	No Bid	\$ 29.88	\$ 25.45	\$ 26.45	\$ 30.38	\$ 26.45	\$ 26.45
ELBA	No Bid	\$ 28.50	No Bid	\$ 27.96	\$ 27.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 28.46	\$ 28.50	No Bid
GOODLAND	No Bid	\$ 29.15	No Bid	\$ 31.08	\$ 28.15	\$ 30.25	\$ 31.58	\$ 29.15	No Bid
HADLEY	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid	\$ 28.98	\$ 28.50	\$ 26.39	\$ 29.48	\$ 29.50	No Bid
IMLAY	No Bid	\$ 26.25	No Bid	\$ 29.88	\$ 25.25	\$ 28.34	\$ 30.38	\$ 26.25	No Bid
LAPEER	No Bid	\$ 28.70	No Bid	\$ 29.28	\$ 27.75	\$ 30.25	\$ 29.78	\$ 28.70	\$ 28.34
MARATHON	No Bid	\$ 29.25	No Bid	\$ 27.96	\$ 28.25	\$ 30.25	\$ 28.46	\$ 29.25	No Bid
MAYFIELD	No Bid	\$ 28.95	No Bid	\$ 29.58	\$ 27.95	\$ 30.25	\$ 30.08	\$ 28.95	No Bid
METAMORA	No Bid	\$ 30.15	No Bid	\$ 29.58	\$ 29.15	\$ 30.25	\$ 30.08	\$ 30.15	No Bid
NORTH BRANCH	No Bid	\$ 29.00	No Bid	\$ 29.58	\$ 28.00	\$ 30.25	\$ 30.08	\$ 29.00	No Bid
OREGON	No Bid	\$ 29.00	No Bid	\$ 28.08	\$ 28.00	\$ 30.25	\$ 28.58	\$ 29.00	No Bid
RICH	No Bid	\$ 30.25	No Bid	\$ 29.58	\$ 29.25	\$ 30.25	\$ 30.08	\$ 30.25	No Bid

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2025-10 GRAVEL HAUL / Alternate 2

Truck Material: Deliver to site (stockpile) and/or spread on road

<i>Company Telephone</i>	Bob Alexander 810-346-2567		Detroit Bulk 313-841-7470		Latigo 810-724-006	
	Lead	Train	Lead	Train	Lead	Train
	30 Ton min. <i>Per Ton</i>	50 Ton min. <i>Per Ton</i>	30 Ton min. <i>Per Ton</i>	50 Ton min. <i>Per Ton</i>	30 Ton min. <i>Per Ton</i>	50 Ton min. <i>Per Ton</i>
HAULING ONE-WAY						
5 MILES	\$ 4.50	\$ 3.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.18	\$ 3.34
10 MILES	\$ 4.80	\$ 3.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.45	\$ 3.54
15 MILES	\$ 5.10	\$ 3.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.74	\$ 3.79
20 MILES	\$ 5.40	\$ 4.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.36	\$ 4.29
25 MILES	\$ 5.70	\$ 4.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.05	\$ 4.84
30 MILES	\$ 6.00	\$ 5.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.65	\$ 5.29
35 MILES	\$ 6.50	\$ 5.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.49	\$ 5.99
40 MILES	\$ 7.00	\$ 6.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.48	\$ 6.75
45 MILES	\$ 7.50	\$ 6.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.64	\$ 7.70
50 MILES	\$ 8.00	\$ 7.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.75	\$ 8.60
55 MILES	\$ 8.50	\$ 7.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.92	\$ 9.50
60 MILES	\$ 9.00	\$ 8.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.40	\$ 10.00
65 MILES	\$ 9.50	\$ 8.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.25	\$ 10.50
70 MILES	\$ 10.00	\$ 9.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.99	\$ 11.00