

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2025 - 13 ROADSIDE MOWING

<i>TOWNSHIP</i>	Randy Green Exv			Single Swath	Double Swath	Cost/Hr per Machine
	Single Swath	Double Swath	Cost/Hr per Machine			
ALMONT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
ARCADIA	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 95.00			
ATTICA	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 95.00			
BURLINGTON	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 95.00			
BURNSIDE	\$ 4,800.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 95.00			
DEERFIELD	\$ 4,700.00	\$ 5,800.00	\$ 95.00			
DRYDEN	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 95.00			
ELBA	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 95.00			
GOODLAND	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 95.00			
HADLEY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
IMLAY	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 4,700.00	\$ 95.00			
LAPEER	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 95.00			
MARATHON	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 95.00			
MAYFIELD	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 95.00			
METAMORA	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 5,700.00	\$ 95.00			
NORTH BRANCH	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 5,800.00	\$ 95.00			
OREGON	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 95.00			
RICH	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 95.00			