COMPANY
PHONE #

Flynn's LLC
Justin Flynn
Marlette

989-635-2676

Edwards Tree
Service

810-678-3593

Lapeer County Road Commission
2025 - 14 Tree and Brush Removal

CAPACITY/ COSTWITH COSTW/OUT

EQUIPMENT TYPE MAKE MODEL SIZE OPERATOR  OPERATOR
2 man crew bucke.t tru.ck, chipper, all tools $130.00 No Bid
for trimming and removal

Track Lift (2) CMC 83HD $125.00 No Bid
Chip Truck (3) $65.00 No Bid
Mini Skid Steer (2) Vermeer CTX100 $50.00 No Bid
Stump Grinder Vermeer $100.00 No Bid
Bobcat With Fecon Mower Bobcat T870 $200.00 No Bid
Bobcat Grapple/Bucket/Forks Bobcat T870 $125.00 No Bid
Grapple (Log) Truck Sterling 30 Yard $120.00 No Bid
Crane 100' Pioneer 27 1/2 Ton Pioneer 100’ $225.00 No Bid
12" Chipper (3) 12" $75.00 No Bid
Truck and Chipper $ 140.00 No Bid
Mini Excavator with grapple thumb or .

forestery shear (OMEF) $150.00 No Bid
Bucket Truck Ford Altec 60' $125.00 No Bid
Chipper Truck Ford 550-Dump 12Yard $90.00 No Bid
Chipper Truck Ford 750-Dump 14X72 $115.00 No Bid
Chipper Bandit 15XP 15" $90.00 No Bid
Stump Grinder Bandit 2800 18" Deep $135.00 No Bid
Skid Steer Deere 332 100 $115.00 No Bid
Mulching Mower Rayco C100 6" $170.00 No Bid
Mini Loader Cormidi C1200 $70.00 No Bid
Track Lift aerial lift 72" $125.00 No Bid
2 Man Crew Bucket Truck, All Tools $240.00 No Bid
Laborer Chainsaw $75.00 No Bid
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BUCKET TRUCK (3) FORD F-750 65' $125.00 $125.00
CHIPPER TRUCK (5) FORD F-650 18YD $100.00 $100.00
JDM Site Services [CHIPPER (2) BANDIT 19XPC 19" $150.00 $150.00
CHIPPER BANDIT 15 15" $80.00 $80.00
248-764-3956 LARGE SKID STEER DEERE 333G N//A $125.00 $125.00
MINI SKID STEER (3) DITCH WITCH SK1550 N/A $70.00 $70.00
SMALL SKID STEER DEERE 317G N/A $70.00 $70.00
MULCHING MOWER BRADCO 31090 5" $150.00 $150.00
LARGE STUMP GRINDER BANDIT 2550T 18" DEEP $125.00 $125.00
SMALL STUMP GRINDER BANDIT 2T1844 10" DEEP $100.00 $100.00
MINI EXCAVATOR W/ GRAPPLE DEERE 75G N/A $150.00 $150.00
WHEEL LOADER DEERE 304L N/A $150.00 $150.00
CRANE PIONEER 80 TON 105' REACH $250.00 $250.00
DUMP TRUCK (2) GMC 5500 N/A $55.00 $55.00
PICK UP TRUCK GMC 3500/3300/15 N/A $55.00 $55.00
,?,(I;/[OALI; CREW BUCKET TRUCK ALL FORD 750 65 FEET $250.00 $250.00
2 man crew bucket truck all tools FORD 750 65 feet $225.00 $225.00
FLAT BED AND CHIPPER CHEVY 5500 65 FEET $160.00 $160.00
TRUCK LIFT AERIAL LIFT GMC72 72' $125.00 $125.00
Tree Harveter Sennebogen 718E 45' $328.00 No Bid
Whole Tree Chipper Albach Diamont 2000 40" $ 446.25 No Bid
KappenTree | . Mower New Holland T6030 4 $136.00 No Bid
Services
Semi Peterbilt 357 130 yard $136.00 No Bid
989-550-8825 Feller Buncher John Deere 753] 24" $273.00 No Bid
2 man crew, bucket and chipper International & Bandit 4300and 12X 60'"and 12" $175.00 No Bid
Continued: 3 man crew, bucket and chipper International & Bandit 4300and 12X 60'and 12" $218.00 No Bid
Tree Mek Crane Kenworth & Palfinger T880 110 $382.00 No Bid
Chip Truck International 4300 30 yard $98.00 No Bid
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Continued: Log Truck w/Self Loader International 4300 30 yard $136.00 No Bid
Winch Chipper Bandit 19XPC 19" $76.00 No Bid
KappenTree ¢ @b Grinder Bandit BTC150 150 $120.00 No Bid
Services
Loader with Grapple Swinger 3000 3000 $103.00 No Bid
989-550-8825 ,ii;ﬁztrry Mower with Utility Truckand p o €120 5' $191.00 No Bid
Whole Tree Crane Albach Fallbach 8000' at 80' $450.00 No Bid
Mongoose . o stry Mulcher Fecon FTX150-2 150HP $ 200.00 $125.00
Construction
810-358-9555
Bucket Truck 52' to 55' International Hi Ranager 1 man $112.00 No Bid
Bucket Truck 65' Freightliner Hi Ranager 1 man $117.00 No Bid
OwenTree . per Bandit 12xp 12" $90.00 No Bid
Service
Log Truck GMC Prentice 30 Yard $165.00 No Bid
810-724-6651 Stump Grinder Rayco RG-100 any size $165.00 No Bid
Chip Truck various dump 25 yard $90.00 No Bid
Tub Grinder Duratech 3010 w/ z:l‘;i‘; ort $550.00 No Bid
Track Mower Takeuchi Fecon 6 ft $240.00 No Bid
2 man crew bucket/chipper/all hand tools for trimming 2 man crew $180.00 No Bid
and removal
3 man crew bucket/chipper/all hand tools for trimming 3 man crew $270.00 No Bid
and removal
3 man clearing crew bucket/chipper/all hand tools for trimming all r.1eeded $400.00 No Bid
and removal  equipment
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RGreen Exv |Brush Axe Mower John Deere 60 inches $125.00 No Bid|
810-656-4499
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