LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2026 - 2 Bituminous Mix Materials

Ace-Saginaw Cadillac Asphalt, Pavt Maintenance Ajax
ITEMS . .
Paving LLC System Materials
Contact Nathan Gotts Jason Teper Julie Dockham Brian Borich
Office: 810-238-1737 248-228-6281 810-724-4767 248-244-3355
Cell: 989-737-2863 248-228-6281 248-388-1687
PLANT MIX 13A Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
PICKED UP $82.50 No Bid No Bid $ 86.50
FOB LAPEER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB NB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB IC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
UPM
PICKED UP No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00
FOB LAPEER No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.75
FOB NB No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.00
FOB IC No Bid No Bid No Bid $136.85
QPR 2000
PICKED UP $132.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB LAPEER $134.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB NB $134.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB IC $136.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
*Alternate 5EL Comm CM-300 CM-300 SP.M C.B
Liquid
PICKED UP $83.50 $135.00 $120.00 $125.00
FOB LAPEER No Bid $147.00 $127.00 $130.00
FOB NB No Bid $149.00 $130.00 $135.00
FOB IMLAY No Bid $ 145.00 $125.00 $132.00
Bituminous Mixture 3EML (Tier 1) PG 64-28
PICKED UP No Bid No Bid No Bid $92.00
FOB LAPEER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB NB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB IMLAY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bituminous Mixture 4EML (Tier 1) PG 64-28
PICKED UP No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.00
FOB LAPEER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB NB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB IMLAY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bituminous Mixture 5EML (Tier 1) PG 64-28
PICKED UP No Bid No Bid No Bid $96.00
FOB LAPEER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB NB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB IMLAY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bituminous Mixture 3EML (Tier 2) PG 64-28
PICKED UP No Bid No Bid No Bid $87.00
FOB LAPEER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB NB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FOB IMLAY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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