Lapeer County Road Commission

2026 - 5 Dust Control

CALCIUM CHLORIDE 38%
DELIVERED & SPREAD

Company

Liquid Calcium

NATURAL BRINE
DELIVERED & SPREAD
Company Wilkinson C(():l:;lg;;ngll S(:(:;lll()tll::)(:les Big Barney's
Contact Eric Farnsworth Andrew Devich Kim Cole Byron Myer
Office: 989-843-6163 734-237-5950 517-521-2124 517-546-8755
Cell: 586-746-9423 734-320-1350
Township

ALMONT $0.250 $0.220 $0.280 $0.185
ARCADIA $0.250 $0.220 No Bid $0.185
ATTICA $0.250 $0.220 No Bid $0.185
BURLINGTON $0.205 No Bid No Bid No Bid
BURNSIDE $0.205 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DEERFIELD $0.205 No Bid $0.280 No Bid
DRYDEN $0.250 $0.220 No Bid $0.185
ELBA $0.250 $0.220 $0.280 $0.185
GOODLAND $0.250 $0.220 $0.280 $0.185
HADLEY $0.250 $0.220 $0.280 $0.185
IMLAY $0.250 $0.220 No Bid $0.185
LAPEER $0.250 $0.220 $0.280 $0.185
MARATHON $0.205 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MAYFIELD $0.250 $0.220 $0.280 $0.185
METAMORA $0.250 $0.220 $0.280 $0.185
NORTH BRANCH $0.205 No Bid $0.280 No Bid
OREGON $0.250 $0.220 $0.280 $0.185
RICH $0.205 No Bid No Bid $0.185
Pick up at Plant $0.100 $0.100 $0.280 $0.110

Annual Bids - #05
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Chloride Sales

Contact Rodney Gerard

Office: 989-684-5860

Cell:
Township

ALMONT $0.822
ARCADIA $0.822
ATTICA $0.822
BURLINGTON $0.822
BURNSIDE $0.822
DEERFIELD $0.822
DRYDEN $0.822
ELBA $0.822
GOODLAND $0.822
HADLEY $0.822
IMLAY $0.822
LAPEER $0.822
MARATHON $0.822
MAYFIELD $0.822
METAMORA $0.822
NORTH BRANCH $0.822
OREGON $0.822
RICH $0.822
Pick up at Plant $0.822




