
LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2026 - 13 ROADSIDE MOWING 

Company R Green Exv S&L Landscape J Joblonski and Sons, Inc.

Contact Randy Green Shaun Roberts Joe Jablonski

Phone 810-656-4499 586-453-9687 616-437-6455

TOWNSHIP
Gravel

Miles

Single

Swath

Double

Swath

Cost/Hr

per Machine

Single

Swath

Double

Swath

Cost/Hr

per Machine

Single

Swath

Double

Swath

Cost/Hr

per Machine

ALMONT 57.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  4,588.00 $  5,793.00 $  92.00 $  10,000.00 $  11,185.00 No Bid

ARCADIA 42.61 $  3,200.00 $  4,500.00 $  105.00 $  3,025.00 $  4,175.00 $  92.00 $  4,644.00 $  8,308.95 No Bid

ATTICA 53.76 $  4,000.00 $  5,500.00 $  105.00 $  3,816.00 $  5,268.00 $  92.00 $  5,859.00 $  10,483.00 No Bid

BURLINGTON 45.01 $  3,500.00 $  5,000.00 $  105.00 $  3,195.00 $  4,410.00 $  92.00 $  4,906.00 $  8,776.00 No Bid

BURNSIDE 73.88 $  4,800.00 $  6,500.00 $  105.00 $  4,506.00 $  6,279.00 $  92.00 $  8,052.00 $  14,406.60 No Bid

DEERFIELD 59.18 $  4,700.00 $  5,800.00 $  105.00 $  4,497.00 $  5,503.00 $  92.00 $  6,450.00 $  11,540.00 No Bid

DRYDEN 52.56 $  4,000.00 $  6,000.00 $  105.00 $  3,836.00 $  5,413.00 $  92.00 $  5,729.00 $  10,249.00 No Bid

ELBA 50.4 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  3,326.00 $  4,687.00 $  92.00 $  5,493.00 $  9,828.00 No Bid

GOODLAND 52.73 $  4,500.00 $  5,500.00 $  105.00 $  4,218.00 $  5,167.00 $  92.00 $  5,747.00 $  10,282.00 No Bid

HADLEY 43.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  3,695.00 $  4,434.00 $  92.00 $  7,609.00 $  8,478.00 No Bid

IMLAY 47.36 $  3,500.00 $  4,700.00 $  105.00 $  3,315.00 $  4,404.00 $  92.00 $  5,162.00 $  9,235.00 No Bid

LAPEER 42.79 $  3,500.00 $  4,600.00 $  105.00 $  3,337.00 $  4,407.00 $  92.00 $  4,664.00 $  8,344.00 No Bid

MARATHON 51.31 $  4,000.00 $  5,500.00 $  105.09 $  3,848.00 $  5,284.00 $  92.00 $  5,592.00 $  10,005.00 No Bid

MAYFIELD 55.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  2,851.00 $  4,305.00 $  92.00 $  6,094.00 $  10,902.00 No Bid

METAMORA 47.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  3,818.00 $  5,279.00 $  92.00 $  5,138.00 $  9,192.00 No Bid

NORTH BRANCH 57.43 $  4,000.00 $  5,800.00 $  105.00 $  3,847.00 $  5,455.00 $  92.00 $  6,259.00 $  11,198.00 No Bid

OREGON 58.04 $  4,000.00 $  6,000.00 $  105.00 $  3,888.00 $  5,687.00 $  92.00 $  6,326.00 $  11,317.00 No Bid

RICH 58.42 $  4,000.00 $  5,500.00 $  105.00 $  3,914.00 $  5,257.00 $  92.00 $  6,367.00 $  11,391.00 No Bid
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