
Lapeer County Road Commission 

2026 - 14 Tree and Brush Removal

COMPANY

PHONE #
EQUIPMENT TYPE MAKE MODEL

CAPACITY/

SIZE

COST WITH

OPERATOR

COST W/OUT

OPERATOR

 

Bucket Truck 55' to 60' International Hi-Ranger 1 man $  112.00 No Bid

Bucket Truck 65' Freightliner Hi-Ranger 1 man $  117.00 No Bid

Owen Tree Service Chipper Bandit 12 xp 12-inch $  112.00 No Bid

Randy Owen Log Truck GMC Prentice 30 yard $  165.00 No Bid

810-724-6651 Stump Grinder Rayco RG - 100 Any Size $  165.00 No Bid

Chip Truck Various Dump 25 yard $  112.00 No Bid

Tub Grinder Duratech 3010 w/ support equipment $  550.00 No Bid

Track Mower Takeuchi Fecon 6-ft $  240.00 No Bid

2 Man Crew
Bucket / Chipper / All 

Hand Tools

Trimming & 

Removal
$  224.00 No Bid

3 Man Crew
Bucket / Chipper / All 

Hand Tools

Trimming & 

Removal
$  336.00 No Bid

3 Man Clearing Crew
Bucket / Chipper / All 

Hand Tools
For Clearing $  450.00 No Bid

Chip Truck International MV 14 yards $  130.00 No Bid

Brush Chipper Bandit 19XPC 13-inch $  130.00 No Bid

Davey Tree Co Stumper Bandit 2650 T 15-inch below grade $  135.00 No Bid

Daniel Miliken Log Loader ASV 120 Forestry 4400 lbs $  130.00 No Bid

810-614-2975 Aerial Lift Freightliner M2106 85-ft $  130.00 No Bid

Mulcher ASV w/ Loftness 120 Forestry 6-inch $  250.00 No Bid

Bucket Truck International Hi-Ranger 60-ft 1 man $  125.00 No Bid

Bucket Truck International Hi-Ranger 60-ft 2 man $  125.00 No Bid

Raymond's Tree Inc. Bucket Truck Ford Hi-Ranger 70-ft 2 man $  125.00 No Bid

Lonny Raymond Chipper Morbark 2100-D 12-inch logs $  125.00 No Bid

810-537-1757 Chipper Morbark 17-D 18-inch logs $  125.00 No Bid

Stump Grinder Rayco RG50 Any Size $  125.00 No Bid

Skidsteer Mustang 2040 1 man $  125.00 No Bid

2 Man Crew Bucket & Chipper All Tools Trimming $  200.00 No Bid

3 Man Crew Bucket & Chipper All Tools Removals $  225.00 No Bid
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Tree Harvester Sennebogen 45-ft $  328.00 No Bid

Whole Tree Chipper Diamont 2000 40-inch $  450.00 No Bid

Boom Mower New Holland $  140.00 No Bid

Semi with Chip Trailer Peterbilt 130 yards $  175.00 No Bid

Kappen
2 man crew with Bucket & 

Chipper International 60-ft
$  185.00 No Bid

3 man crew with Bucket & 

Chipper International 60-ft
$  225.00 No Bid

Fellerbuncher John Deere 753J $  275.00 No Bid

Tree Mech Crane Peterbilt 106-ft $  382.00 No Bid

Chip Truck International 30 yards $  98.00 No Bid

Log Truck International 35 yards $  150.00 No Bid

Winch Chipper Bandit 18-inch $  76.00 No Bid

Stump Grinder Carlton $  120.00 No Bid

Loader with Grapple John Deere 325 $  103.00 No Bid

Utility Truck with Forestry 

Mower Rayco 120
$  195.00 No Bid

Bucket Truck Ford Altec 60-ft $  125.00 No Bid

Chipper Truck Ford 550-Dump 12-yard $  90.00 No Bid

Chipper Truck Ford 750-Dump 14 x 72 $  115.00 No Bid

Edwards Tree Chipper Truck Bandit 15XP 15-inch $  90.00 No Bid

& Land Clearing Stump Grinder Bandit 2800 18-inch Deep $  135.00 No Bid

Skid Steer John Deere 332 100 $  115.00 No Bid

Mulching Mower Rayco C100 6-inch $  170.00 No Bid

Mini Loader Cormidi C1200 $  70.00 No Bid

Track Lift Aerial Lift 72-inch $  125.00 No Bid

Sennebogen 718E 45 $  300.00 No Bid

3 Man Crew Bucket Truck, All Tools $  375.00 No Bid

2 Man Crew Bucket Truck, All Tools $  240.00 No Bid

Laborer Chainsaw $  75.00 No Bid
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