
LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2026-16  Reinforced Concrete Structure and Pipe    

Company Northern Concrete Pipe, Inc Marlette Excavating

Contact Jim Washabaugh Launce Sulaty

Phone 989-892-3545 x 104 989-635-2998

Part 1

Diameter Class Price / Lin Ft Price / Lin Ft

12" IV $ 16.44 No Bid

15" IV $ 20.63 No Bid

18" IV $ 27.17 No Bid

21" IV $ 33.60 No Bid

24" IV $ 41.97 No Bid

30" IV $ 66.94 No Bid

36" IV $ 89.54 No Bid

42" IV $ 114.36 No Bid

48" IV $ 149.73 No Bid

54" IV $ 185.98 No Bid

60" IV $ 237.43 No Bid

66" IV $ 293.25 No Bid

72" IV $ 319.80 No Bid

Part 2

Diameter Class Price / Lin Ft Price / Lin Ft

18" (14"x23") III / IV $40.78 / $42.31 No Bid

24" (19"x30") III / IV $55.76 / $60.41 No Bid

30" (24"x38") III / IV $74.16 / $79.96 No Bid

36" (29"x45") III / IV $101.94 / $129.78 No Bid

42" (34"x53") III / IV $149.21 / $170.20 No Bid

48" (38"x60") III / IV $188.20 / $296.06 No Bid

54" (43"x68") III / IV $237.23 / $383.99 No Bid

60" (48"x76") III / IV $277.44 / $468.16 No Bid

66" (53"x83") III / IV $327.49 / $528.28 No Bid

72" (58"x91") III / IV $387.14 / $621.39 No Bid

Part 3

Size Price / Lin Ft Price / Lin Ft

$ 3,551.00 See Attached for Hourly Rates

$ 2,268.00 See Attached for Hourly Rates

Culv, Precast Conc Box, 25 foot by 14 

foot with headwalls & wingwalls

Culv, Precast Conc Box, 14 foot by 5 foot 

with headwalls & wingwalls
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Marlette Excavating Company 

6855 Marlette St. 
Marlette, MI 48453 

Phone: (989) 635-2998 
Fax: (989) 635-5082 

 

Reinforced Concrete Pipe and Structures Installation Bid 

 

Reinforced pipe 12” to 36” and structures up to 36”  

Cat 320 excavator $145.00 per hour 
Cat 336 excavator $200.00 per hour 
Up to three laborers $55.00 per hour per laborer 
Backhoe as needed $80.00 per hour 

 

Reinforced pipe 42” to 72”, Box culvert installation, and structures up to 72” 

Cat 336 excavator $200.00 per hour per excavator 
Cat 235D Excavator $200.00 per hour 
Cat 320 excavator $145.00 
Up to three laborers $55.00 per hour per laborer 
Backhoe as needed $80.00 per hour 
Loader as need $100.00 
 

As needed:  

Pipe laser $50.00 per day 
Bypass Pump:  3” $100.00 per day 
  4” $ 150.00 per day 
Compactor: Cat 534 $110.00 per hour 
          Hypac C747B $55.00 
 

 

 

-Exact equipment and labor to be used to be discussed and agreed upon with Lapeer County Road 
Commission per project. The prices are for installation only all base and backfill material to be supplied 
by the owner.*------------- 
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